

**COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER**  
**Central Purchasing**  
**Bid Tabulation Sheet**

Opening Date: January 14, 2020 @ 2:00 p.m.	<b>JR Finley Drywal</b>	<b>Best Way Custom Homes</b>	<b>Atlantic Spray Systems</b>	<b>Hughes Electrical</b>	<b>Premier HVAC</b>
Buyer: Christine Joyce					
Bid Opener: Pam Allen					
Bid Tabulator: Pam Allen					
Bid #: <b>IFB 20-012-CJ</b>					
County Animal Control Renovation					
Work Discipline #1	No bid	\$73,000.00	No bid	No bid	No bid
Work Discipline #2	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
Work Discipline #3	No bid	\$8,000.00	No bid	No bid	No bid
Work Discipline #4	No bid	\$8,500.00	No bid	No bid	No bid
Work Discipline #5	\$7,600.00	\$18,000.00	No bid	No bid	No bid
Work Discipline #6	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
Work Discipline #7	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
Work Discipline #8	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
Work Discipline #9	No bid	\$19,500.00	No bid	No bid	\$12,650.00
Work Discipline #10	No bid	\$14,500.00	No bid	No bid	No bid



**COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER**  
**Central Purchasing**  
**Bid Tabulation Sheet**

Opening Date: January 14, 2020 @ 2:00 p.m.	CT Redd Construction	Commercial Roofing	Mosaic Building Solutions	Extreme Climates	Benchmark Heating & Cooling
Buyer: Christine Joyce					
Bid Opener: Pam Allen					
Bid Tabulator: Pam Allen					
Bid #: <a href="#">IFB 20-012-CJ</a>					
County Animal Control Renovation					
Work Discipline #1	No bid	No bid	\$84,300.00	No bid	No bid
Work Discipline #2	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
Work Discipline #3	No bid	\$7,875.00	No bid	No bid	No bid
Work Discipline #4	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
Work Discipline #5	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
Work Discipline #6	No bid	No bid	\$20,788.00	No bid	No bid
Work Discipline #7	\$13,338.00	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
Work Discipline #8	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
Work Discipline #9	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$9,850.00	\$14,587.00
Work Discipline #10	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid



**COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER**  
**Central Purchasing**  
**Bid Tabulation Sheet**

Opening Date: January 14, 2020 @ 2:00 p.m.	<b>L&amp;M Electrical &amp; Plumbing</b>	<b>Medhus Construction</b>	<b>Ashett Mechanical</b>	<b>Drain Wizard</b>	<b>Virginia Painting</b>
Buyer: Christine Joyce					
Bid Opener: Pam Allen					
Bid Tabulator: Pam Allen					
Bid #: <b>IFB 20-012-CJ</b> County Animal Control Renovation					
Work Discipline #1	\$46,500.00	\$45,663.00	No bid	No bid	No bid
Work Discipline #2	\$6,400.00	\$7,000.00	No bid	No bid	No bid
Work Discipline #3	\$10,500.00	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
Work Discipline #4	\$8,600.00	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
Work Discipline #5	\$18,100.00	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
Work Discipline #6	\$19,200.00	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
Work Discipline #7	\$28,000.00	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
Work Discipline #8	\$20,900.00	No bid	No bid	\$15,800	No bid
Work Discipline #9	\$29,500.00	No bid	\$9,165.00	No bid	No bid
Work Discipline #10	\$18,300.00	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$8,746.30

